
HVAC Filters 08052-C
Opened on August 12, 2008
Matthew Bauer & Charles Hinegardener

1.0 PRICING:
Annual release date of  manufacture's catalog(s): January Pleated

January Rigid Box
No Bid Tri-Dek (or equivalent)

Price/ea.

1.1 11x15x1 $3.48
1.2 8x26x1 $3.65
1.3 8x36x1 $3.65
1.4 9x34x1 $4.80
1.5 10x20x1 $1.43
1.6 10x24x1 $3.65
1.7 10x28x1 $3.65
1.8 12x12x1 $2.38
1.9 12x20x1 $1.98

1.10 12x24x1 $1.66
1.11 14x20x1 $1.48
1.12 14x22x1 $4.80

 Camfill Farr

 PLEATED FILTER



1.13. 14x25x1 $1.90
1.14 15x15x1 $3.65
1.15 15x18x1 $3.65
1.16 15x33x1 $5.58
1.17 16x24x1 $2.18
1.18 16x20x1 $1.63
1.19 16x22x1 $4.80
1.20 14x54x1 $11.18
1.21 18x25x1 $2.19
1.22 16x30x1 $5.58
1.23 18x30x1 $7.73
1.24 20x20x1 $1.85
1.25 20x25x1 $2.17
1.26 20x30x1 $2.94
1.27 22x22x1 $2.75
1.28 24x24x1 $2.51
1.29 28x28x1 $11.18
1.30 10x20x2 $2.12
1.31 12x12x2 $2.12
1.32 12x20x2 $2.79
1.33 12x24x2 $1.78
1.34 14x20x2 $1.87
1.35 14x28x2 $5.05
1.36 14x30x2 $6.13
1.37 15x18x2 $3.98
1.38 15x20x2 $1.88
1.39 16x16x2 $2.79
1.40 16x20x2 $1.89
1.41 16x24x2 $2.18
1.42 16x25x2 $2.19
1.43 16x32x2 $8.45
1.44 18x24x2 $2.41



1.45 18x25x2 $2.32
1.46 18x35.5x2 $9.33 1
1.47 20x20x2 $2.19
1.48 20x24x2 $2.30
1.49 20x25x2 $2.41
1.50 20x30x2 $8.45
1.51 22x27x2 $8.45
1.52 24x24x2 $2.77
1.53 25x25x2 $3.01
1.54 12x24x4 $3.24
1.55 16x20x4 $3.70
1.56 16x25x4 $4.17
1.57 20x20x4 $4.17
1.58 20x25x4 $4.78
1.59 24x24x4 $5.14
1.60 14x30x1 $6.13
1.61 8x30x1 $3.65
1.64 8x20x1 $3.48
1.66 22x28x2 $9.33
1.67 26x29x2 $12.30

1.68 12x24x12 30.29 1
1.69 24x24x12 39.94 2
1.70 20x20x12 36.73 2

1.71 11x15x1 No-Bid
1.72 8x26x1 No-Bid

RIGID BOX FILTERS

TRI-DEK 2-PLY



1.73 8x36x1 No-Bid
1.74 9x34x1 No-Bid
1.75 10x20x1 No-Bid
1.76 10x24x1 No-Bid
1.77 10x28x1 No-Bid
1.78 12x12x1 No-Bid
1.79 12x20x1 No-Bid
1.80 12x24x1 No-Bid
1.81 14x20x1 No-Bid
1.82 14x22x1 No-Bid
1.83 14x25x1 No-Bid
1.84 15x15x1 No-Bid
1.85 15x18x1 No-Bid
1.86 15x33x1 No-Bid
1.87 16x24x1 No-Bid
1.88 16x20x1 No-Bid
1.89 16x22x1 No-Bid
1.90 14x54x1 No-Bid
1.91 18x25x1 No-Bid
1.92 16x30x1 No-Bid
1.93 18x30x1 No-Bid
1.94 20x20x1 No-Bid
1.95 20x25x1 No-Bid
1.96 20x30x1 No-Bid
1.97 22x22x1 No-Bid
1.98 24x24x1 No-Bid
1.99 28x28x1 No-Bid

1.100 14x30x1 No-Bid
1.101 8x30x1 No-Bid
1.102 8x20x1 No-Bid

TRI-DEK 3-PLY



1.103 10x20x2 No-Bid
1.104 12x12x2 No-Bid
1.105 12x20x2 No-Bid
1.106 12x24x2 No-Bid
1.107 14x20x2 No-Bid
1.108 14x28x2 No-Bid
1.109 14x30x2 No-Bid
1.110 15x18x2 No-Bid
1.111 15x20x2 No-Bid
1.112 16x16x2 No-Bid
1.113 16x20x2 No-Bid
1.114 16x24x2 No-Bid
1.115 16x25x2 No-Bid
1.116 16x32x2 No-Bid
1.117 18x24x2 No-Bid
1.118 18x25x2 No-Bid
1.119 18x35.5x2 No-Bid 1
1.120 20x20x2 No-Bid
1.121 20x24x2 No-Bid
1.122 20x25x2 No-Bid
1.123 20x30x2 No-Bid
1.124 22x27x2 No-Bid
1.125 24x24x2 No-Bid
1.126 25x25x2 No-Bid
1.127 12x24x4 No-Bid
1.128 22x28x2 No-Bid
1.129 26x29x2 No-Bid

TRI-DEK 4-PLY



1.30 12x24x4 No-Bid
1.31 16x20x4 No-Bid
1.32 16x25x4 No-Bid
1.33 20x20x4 No-Bid
1.34 20x25x4 No-Bid
1.35 24x24x4 No-Bid



Feb-09 Pleated January Pleated
Feb-09 Rigid Box January Rigid Box
Feb-09 Tri-Dek (or equivalent) January Tri-Dek (or equivalent)

Price/ea. Price/ea.

11x15x1 $2.04 11x15x1 $12.79
8x26x1 $2.87 8x26x1 $14.51
8x36x1 $3.44 8x36x1 $19.12
9x34x1 $3.02 9x34x1 $19.12

10x20x1 $1.19 10x20x1 $9.23
10x24x1 $2.24 10x24x1 $14.53
10x28x1 $3.08 10x28x1 $14.53
12x12x1 $2.44 12x12x1 $7.00
12x20x1 $2.49 12x20x1 $12.79
12x24x1 $1.24 12x24x1 $12.65
14x20x1 $1.32 14x20x1 $11.51
14x22x1 $2.69 14x22x1 $14.53

Air EnergyAire Filter Products

 PLEATED FILTER PLEATED FILTER



14x25x1 $1.63 14x25x1 $13.87
15x15x1 $2.47 15x15x1 $14.36
15x18x1 $2.47 15x18x1 $14.36
15x33x1 $3.21 15x33x1 $22.03
16x24x1 $2.68 16x24x1 $14.24
16x20x1 $1.44 16x20x1 $13.69
16x22x1 $2.42 16x22x1 $14.91
14x54x1 $4.04 14x54x1 $35.85
18x25x1 $2.11 18x25x1 $18.65
16x30x1 $2.91 16x30x1 $22.03
18x30x1 $2.91 18x30x1 $24.83
20x20x1 $1.51 20x20x1 $16.19
20x25x1 $1.81 20x25x1 $19.40
20x30x1 $2.91 20x30x1 $24.95
22x22x1 $3.52 22x22x1 $21.92
24x24x1 $2.16 24x24x1 $21.25
28x28x1 $3.52 28x28x1 $21.47
10x20x2 $2.05 10x20x2 $11.96
12x12x2 $2.51 12x12x2 $7.71
12x20x2 $2.14 12x20x2 $16.72
12x24x2 $1.51 12x24x2 $15.39
14x20x2 $1.64 14x20x2 $14.24
14x28x2 $3.31 14x28x2 $22.16
14x30x2 $3.31 14x30x2 $22.16
15x18x2 $2.71 15x18x2 $17.11
15x20x2 $1.63 15x20x2 $17.11
16x16x2 $2.41 16x16x2 $17.11
16x20x2 $1.60 16x20x2 $16.44
16x24x2 $1.97 16x24x2 $16.99
16x25x2 $1.79 16x25x2 $18.89
16x32x2 $3.81 16x32x2 $26.15
18x24x2 $2.10 18x24x2 $18.85



18x25x2 $2.08 18x25x2 $21.39
18x35.5x2 $4.07 18x35.5x2 $28.95 18

20x20x2 $1.79 20x20x2 $18.93
20x24x2 $2.00 20x24x2 $22.85
20x25x2 $2.03 20x25x2 $22.15
20x30x2 $3.15 20x30x2 $29.07
22x27x2 $4.44 22x27x2 $34.64
24x24x2 $2.38 24x24x2 $23.99
25x25x2 $2.65 25x25x2 $25.48
12x24x4 $3.49 12x24x4 $20.45
16x20x4 $3.52 16x20x4 $22.24
16x25x4 $3.62 16x25x4 $24.27
20x20x4 $3.62 20x20x4 $25.76
20x25x4 $4.17 20x25x4 $30.11
24x24x4 $3.93 24x24x4 $33.33

14x30x1 $2.91 14x30x1 $17.93 1
8x30x1 $2.91 8x30x1 $14.51
8x20x1 $2.51 8x20x1 $9.76

22x28x2 $2.81 22x28x2 $34.64
26x29x2 $2.81 26x29x2 $34.64

12x24x12 28.51 12x24x12 38.54 12
24x24x12 36.51 24x24x12 46.74 24
20x20x12 31.86 20x20x12 39.98 20

11x15x1 $3.12 11x15x1 $3.56
8x26x1 $3.12 8x26x1 $4.28

RIGID BOX FILTERS

TRI-DEK 2-PLY

RIGID BOX FILTERS

TRI-DEK 2-PLY



8x36x1 $3.19 8x36x1 $4.80
9x34x1 $3.24 9x34x1 $4.80

10x20x1 $3.12 10x20x1 $4.28
10x24x1 $3.12 10x24x1 $4.28
10x28x1 $3.17 10x28x1 $4.28
12x12x1 $3.12 12x12x1 $3.56
12x20x1 $3.12 12x20x1 $3.11
12x24x1 $1.95 12x24x1 $3.11
14x20x1 $3.17 14x20x1 $3.17
14x22x1 $3.17 14x22x1 $4.65
14x25x1 $3.31 14x25x1 $3.29
15x15x1 $3.17 15x15x1 $4.04
15x18x1 $3.17 15x18x1 $4.04
15x33x1 $3.52 15x33x1 $5.25
16x24x1 $2.35 16x24x1 $3.43
16x20x1 $1.95 16x20x1 $3.21
16x22x1 $3.31 16x22x1 $3.29
14x54x1 $4.18 14x54x1 $6.93
18x25x1 $3.52 18x25x1 $3.68
16x30x1 $3.54 16x30x1 $5.25
18x30x1 $3.78 18x30x1 $5.55
20x20x1 $2.40 20x20x1 $3.44
20x25x1 $2.58 20x25x1 $3.68
20x30x1 $3.85 20x30x1 $5.55
22x22x1 $3.68 22x22x1 $5.35
24x24x1 $2.76 24x24x1 $3.88
28x28x1 $4.26 28x28x1 $8.41

14x30x1 $3.58 14x30x1 $5.25 1
8x30x1 $3.44 8x30x1 $4.80
8x20x1 $3.22 8x20x1 $4.28

TRI-DEK 3-PLYTRI-DEK 3-PLY



10x20x2 $3.40 10x20x2 $5.68
12x12x2 $3.40 12x12x2 $4.77
12x20x2 $3.40 12x20x2 $4.07
12x24x2 $2.27 12x24x2 $4.07
14x20x2 $3.40 14x20x2 $4.35
14x28x2 $3.63 14x28x2 $6.37
14x30x2 $3.93 14x30x2 $6.37
15x18x2 $3.57 15x18x2 $5.00
15x20x2 $3.57 15x20x2 $5.00
16x16x2 $3.46 16x16x2 $5.00
16x20x2 $2.20 16x20x2 $4.35
16x24x2 $2.81 16x24x2 $4.65
16x25x2 $2.51 16x25x2 $4.65
16x32x2 $4.23 16x32x2 $7.48
18x24x2 $3.00 18x24x2 $5.13
18x25x2 $3.95 18x25x2 $5.13

18x35.5x2 $4.46 18x35.5x2 $8.33 18
20x20x2 $2.54 20x20x2 $4.63
20x24x2 $3.00 20x24x2 $5.13
20x25x2 $3.08 20x25x2 $5.13
20x30x2 $4.42 20x30x2 $5.13
22x27x2 $4.42 22x27x2 $7.71
24x24x2 $3.52 24x24x2 $5.53
25x25x2 $3.80 25x25x2 $5.77
12x24x4 $2.14 12x24x4 $4.51
22x28x2 $4.46 22x28x2 $7.69
26x29x2 $4.80 26x29x2 $7.88

TRI-DEK 4-PLYTRI-DEK 4-PLY



12x24x4 $2.45 12x24x4 $4.51
16x20x4 $2.71 16x20x4 $4.80
16x25x4 $2.95 16x25x4 $5.17
20x20x4 $2.95 20x20x4 $5.43
20x25x4 $3.57 20x25x4 $5.76
24x24x4 $4.06 24x24x4 $6.23



June 1st Pleated January 1st Pleated
June 1st Rigid Box January 1st Rigid Box
June 1st Tri-Dek (or equivalent) January 1st Tri-Dek (or equivalent)

Alternate Merv 8 pleated filte
Price/ea. Price/ea. MERV 8 - Standard Pleated 

11x15x1 $3.81 11x15x1 $15.81 11x15x1 $2.30
8x26x1 $3.97 8x26x1 $16.69 8x26x1 $2.83
8x36x1 $3.97 8x36x1 $16.69 8x36x1 $3.27
9x34x1 $4.03 9x34x1 $17.44 9x34x1 $3.25

10x20x1 $2.36 10x20x1 $16.69 10x20x1 $2.01
10x24x1 $3.97 10x24x1 $16.69 10x24x1 $2.00
10x28x1 $3.97 10x28x1 $16.69 10x28x1 $2.91
12x12x1 $3.81 12x12x1 $15.81 12x12x1 $2.62
12x20x1 $2.36 12x20x1 $16.69 12x20x1 $2.18
12x24x1 $2.36 12x24x1 $16.69 12x24x1 $2.11
14x20x1 $2.53 14x20x1 $11.50 14x20x1 $2.08
14x22x1 $4.03 14x22x1 $17.43 14x22x1 $3.09

Southland Filtration Dave Downing



14x25x1 $2.67 14x25x1 $11.50 14x25x1 $2.21
15x15x1 $3.97 15x15x1 $16.69 15x15x1 $2.96
15x18x1 $3.97 15x18x1 $16.69 15x18x1 $2.96
15x33x1 $4.36 15x33x1 $17.73 15x33x1 $5.59
16x24x1 $2.71 16x24x1 $17.44 16x24x1 $2.31
16x20x1 $2.48 16x20x1 $11.50 16x20x1 $2.00
16x22x1 $4.03 16x22x1 $17.44 16x22x1 $3.13
14x54x1 $8.05 14x54x1 $22.00 14x54x1 $7.64
18x25x1 $2.97 18x25x1 $17.73 18x25x1 $2.73
16x30x1 $4.36 16x30x1 $17.73 16x30x1 $3.79
18x30x1 $4.84 18x30x1 $18.19 18x30x1 $4.68
20x20x1 $2.48 20x20x1 $11.50 20x20x1 $2.25
20x25x1 $2.81 20x25x1 $11.50 20x25x1 $2.60
20x30x1 $5.05 20x30x1 $18.96 20x30x1 $3.95
22x22x1 $4.36 22x22x1 $17.73 22x22x1 $3.87
24x24x1 $3.02 24x24x1 $18.19 24x24x1 $2.71
28x28x1 $8.05 28x28x1 $22.00 28x28x1 $7.64
10x20x2 $2.69 10x20x2 $10.24 10x20x2 $2.48
12x12x2 $4.21 12x12x2 $17.74 12x12x2 $2.00
12x20x2 $2.69 12x20x2 $11.29 12x20x2 $2.53
12x24x2 $2.69 12x24x2 $12.27 12x24x2 $2.48
14x20x2 $2.86 14x20x2 $12.67 14x20x2 $2.55
14x28x2 $6.53 14x28x2 $22.71 14x28x2 $5.28
14x30x2 $5.41 14x30x2 $36.80 14x30x2 $4.44
15x18x2 $4.44 15x18x2 $19.40 15x18x2 $3.52
15x20x2 $2.86 15x20x2 $13.04 15x20x2 $2.55
16x16x2 $4.44 16x16x2 $11.96 16x16x2 $3.91
16x20x2 $2.86 16x20x2 $12.93 16x20x2 $2.15
16x24x2 $3.11 16x24x2 $15.17 16x24x2 $3.05
16x25x2 $3.11 16x25x2 $15.24 16x25x2 $2.50
16x32x2 $6.02 16x32x2 $36.80 16x32x2 $5.00
18x24x2 $3.20 18x24x2 $16.61 18x24x2 $3.32



18x25x2 $3.30 18x25x2 $18.54 18x25x2 $3.38
8x35.5x2 $9.70 18x35.5x2 $43.43 18x35.5x2 $6.29
20x20x2 $3.11 20x20x2 $15.24 20x20x2 $2.50
20x24x2 $3.30 20x24x2 $17.93 20x24x2 $3.38
20x25x2 $3.35 20x25x2 $18.20 20x25x2 $3.02
20x30x2 $6.23 20x30x2 $22.06 20x30x2 $3.64
22x27x2 $6.02 22x27x2 $26.86 22x27x2 $7.50
24x24x2 $3.76 24x24x2 $20.34 24x24x2 $3.39
25x25x2 $4.15 25x25x2 $22.51 25x25x2 $4.05
12x24x4 $4.71 12x24x4 $16.43 12x24x4 $3.73
16x20x4 $4.76 16x20x4 $17.56 16x20x4 $4.48
16x25x4 $5.17 16x25x4 $20.73 16x25x4 $4.74
20x20x4 $5.17 20x20x4 $20.69 20x20x4 $4.74
20x25x4 $5.47 20x25x4 $24.60 20x25x4 $5.34
24x24x4 $5.87 24x24x4 $27.74 24x24x4 $5.76

14x30x1 $4.02 14x30x1 $17.73 14x30x1 $3.25
8x30x1 $3.62 8x30x1 $16.69 8x30x1 $2.46
8x20x1 $3.48 8x20x1 $15.81 8x20x1 $1.66

22x28x2 $6.23 22x28x2 $31.00 22x28x2 $7.49
26x29x2 $9.70 26x29x2 $43.43 26x29x2 $7.46

2x24x12 $69.41 12x24x12 30.49
24x24x12 $82.79 24x24x12 44.23
20x20x12 $71.88 20x20x12 42.59

11x15x1 $3.68 11x15x1 $2.69
8x26x1 $3.68 8x26x1 $2.69

RIGID BOX FILTERS

TRI-DEK 2-PLY

RIGID BOX FILTERS

TRI-DEK 2-PLY



8x36x1 $3.95 8x36x1 $3.10
9x34x1 $4.04 9x34x1 $3.58

10x20x1 $3.68 10x20x1 $2.69
10x24x1 $3.68 10x24x1 $2.69
10x28x1 $3.95 10x28x1 $3.01
12x12x1 $3.68 12x12x1 $2.69
12x20x1 $3.68 12x20x1 $2.69
12x24x1 $3.42 12x24x1 $2.59
14x20x1 $3.95 14x20x1 $3.01
14x22x1 $4.04 14x22x1 $3.31
14x25x1 $4.26 14x25x1 $3.76
15x15x1 $3.68 15x15x1 $2.69
15x18x1 $3.95 15x18x1 $2.90
15x33x1 $4.65 15x33x1 $5.32
16x24x1 $3.75 16x24x1 $4.13
16x20x1 $3.45 16x20x1 $2.98
16x22x1 $4.26 16x22x1 $3.79
14x54x1 $8.52 14x54x1 $8.29
18x25x1 $4.65 18x25x1 $4.84
16x30x1 $4.65 16x30x1 $5.16
18x30x1 $4.76 18x30x1 $5.81
20x20x1 $3.79 20x20x1 $3.43
20x25x1 $4.18 20x25x1 $3.83
20x30x1 $8.08 20x30x1 $6.45
22x22x1 $4.65 22x22x1 $5.21
24x24x1 $4.48 24x24x1 $4.32
28x28x1 $8.51 28x28x1 $8.43

14x30x1 $4.16 14x30x1 $4.84
8x30x1 $3.35 8x30x1 $2.69
8x20x1 $3.35 8x20x1 $2.69

TRI-DEK 3-PLYTRI-DEK 3-PLY



10x20x2 $3.88 10x20x2 $2.69
12x12x2 $3.88 12x12x2 $2.69
12x20x2 $3.88 12x20x2 $2.69
12x24x2 $3.61 12x24x2 $3.01
14x20x2 $4.22 14x20x2 $4.22
14x28x2 $4.55 14x28x2 $4.52
14x30x2 $4.87 14x30x2 $2.90
15x18x2 $4.22 15x18x2 $3.23
15x20x2 $3.57 15x20x2 $2.75
16x16x2 $3.50 16x16x2 $2.98
16x20x2 $3.66 16x20x2 $4.13
16x24x2 $4.00 16x24x2 $3.43
16x25x2 $4.08 16x25x2 $5.51
16x32x2 $5.15 16x32x2 $4.00
18x24x2 $4.54 18x24x2 $6.50
18x25x2 $4.99 18x25x2 $4.84

8x35.5x2 $8.69 18x35.5x2 $6.97
20x20x2 $4.08 20x20x2 $3.43
20x24x2 $4.54 20x24x2 $3.83
20x25x2 $4.66 20x25x2 $3.83
20x30x2 $8.69 20x30x2 $6.45
22x27x2 $5.26 22x27x2 $6.37
24x24x2 $5.28 24x24x2 $4.32
25x25x2 $5.68 25x25x2 $6.72
12x24x4 N/A 12x24x2 $3.01
22x28x2 $8.69 22x28x2 $6.62
26x29x2 $9.09 26x29x2 $8.11

TRI-DEK 4-PLYTRI-DEK 4-PLY



12x24x4 $3.80 12x24x4 $3.01
16x20x4 $3.87 16x20x4 $4.13
16x25x4 $4.33 16x25x4 $5.51
20x20x4 $4.33 20x20x4 $3.43
20x25x4 $4.88 20x25x4 $3.83
24x24x4 $5.52 24x24x4 $4.32



N/A Pleated   February 15th  Pleated
N/A Rigid Box   February 15th  Rigid Box
N/A Tri-Dek (or equivalent)   February 15th  Tri-Dek (or equivalent)

er
 Metal Back Price/ea. Size. Price/ea.

11x15x1 $2.87 11x15x1 $12.39
8x26x1 $3.08 8x26x1 $12.96
8x36x1 $5.73 8x36x1 $12.96
9x34x1 $5.73 9x34x1 $16.28

10x20x1 $1.78 10x20x1 $6.92
10x24x1 $3.08 10x24x1 $12.96
10x28x1 $3.08 10x28x1 $12.96
12x12x1 $2.87 12x12x1 $8.03
12x20x1 $1.85 12x20x1 $8.78
12x24x1 $1.97 12x24x1 $8.49
14x20x1 $1.92 14x20x1 $8.27
14x22x1 $3.53 14x22x1 $16.28

EMI Dusty's Filter

 PLEATED FILTER



14x25x1 $2.03 14x25x1 $9.24
15x15x1 $3.08 15x15x1 $12.96
15x18x1 $3.08 15x18x1 $12.96
15x33x1 $6.18 15x33x1 $18.15
16x24x1 $3.53 16x24x1 $10.60
16x20x1 $1.86 16x20x1 $8.16
16x22x1 $3.53 16x22x1 $16.28
14x54x1 $7.06 14x54x1 $34.07
18x25x1 $2.31 18x25x1 $12.43
16x30x1 $3.89 16x30x1 $10.14
18x30x1 $4.15 18x30x1 $19.00
20x20x1 $2.10 20x20x1 $9.46
20x25x1 $2.43 20x25x1 $11.02
20x30x1 $2.87 20x30x1 $14.34
22x22x1 $3.89 22x22x1 $18.15
24x24x1 $2.53 24x24x1 $12.72
28x28x1 $7.06 28x28x1 $20.15
10x20x2 $1.86 10x20x2 $9.60
12x12x2 $3.17 12x12x2 $11.08
12x20x2 $1.94 12x20x2 $10.46
12x24x2 $1.98 12x24x2 $10.69
14x20x2 $2.15 14x20x2 $10.80
14x28x2 $4.49 14x28x2 $21.57
14x30x2 $4.75 14x30x2 $24.92
15x18x2 $3.77 15x18x2 $17.29
15x20x2 $2.20 15x20x2 $11.64
16x16x2 $3.77 16x16x2 $8.65
16x20x2 $1.87 16x20x2 $11.19
16x24x2 $2.56 16x24x2 $14.53
16x25x2 $2.14 16x25x2 $13.12
16x32x2 $7.53 16x32x2 $26.42
18x24x2 $2.56 18x24x2 $14.80



18x25x2 $2.56 18x25x2 $16.40
18x35.5x2 $8.97 18x35.5x2 $27.72

20x20x2 $2.14 20x20x2 $13.20
20x24x2 $2.56 20x24x2 $15.80
20x25x2 $2.46 20x25x2 $15.70
20x30x2 $5.40 20x30x2 $20.52
22x27x2 $5.14 22x27x2 $26.42
24x24x2 $2.83 24x24x2 $17.83
25x25x2 $3.42 25x25x2 $22.43
12x24x4 $3.31 12x24x4 $19.12
16x20x4 $3.70 16x20x4 $19.36
16x25x4 $3.89 16x25x4 $22.87
20x20x4 $3.89 20x20x4 $23.06
20x25x4 $4.55 20x25x4 $27.31
24x24x4 $5.02 24x24x4 $29.07

14x30x1 $3.89 14x30x1 $18.15
8x30x1 $3.08 8x30x1 $12.96
8x20x1 $2.87 8x20x1 $12.39

22x28x2 $5.40 22x28x2 $27.72
26x29x2 $8.87 26x29x2 $28.88

12x24x12 $24.81 12x24x12 $38.85
24x24x12 $41.58 24x24x12 $58.63
20x20x12 $36.23 20x20x12 $49.63

11x15x1 $2.60 11x15x1 $6.52
8x26x1 $3.08 8x26x1 $6.97

RIGID BOX FILTERS

TRI-DEK 2-PLY

RIGID BOX FILTERS

TRI-DEK 2-PLY



8x36x1 $3.35 8x36x1 $6.97
9x34x1 $3.48 9x34x1 $7.18

10x20x1 $3.08 10x20x1 $3.42
10x24x1 $3.08 10x24x1 $6.97
10x28x1 $3.35 10x28x1 $6.97
12x12x1 $2.44 12x12x1 $6.52
12x20x1 $3.08 12x20x1 $6.97
12x24x1 $2.36 12x24x1 $4.18
14x20x1 $3.35 14x20x1 $6.97
14x22x1 $3.48 14x22x1 $7.18
14x25x1 $3.58 14x25x1 $5.38
15x15x1 $3.08 15x15x1 $6.97
15x18x1 $3.35 15x18x1 $6.97
15x33x1 $3.72 15x33x1 $7.74
16x24x1 $3.08 16x24x1 $7.18
16x20x1 $2.13 16x20x1 $3.21
16x22x1 $3.58 16x22x1 $7.18
14x54x1 $7.46 14x54x1 $13.19
18x25x1 $3.72 18x25x1 $7.74
16x30x1 $3.72 16x30x1 $7.74
18x30x1 $3.89 18x30x1 $6.97
20x20x1 $2.25 20x20x1 $3.38
20x25x1 $2.72 20x25x1 $3.77
20x30x1 $4.01 20x30x1 $9.82
22x22x1 $3.72 22x22x1 $7.74
24x24x1 $2.65 24x24x1 $5.39
28x28x1 $4.39 28x28x1 $13.19

14x30x1 $3.64 14x30x1 $7.74
8x30x1 $3.08 8x30x1 $6.97
8x20x1 $2.60 8x20x1 $6.52

TRI-DEK 3-PLYTRI-DEK 3-PLY



10x20x2 $3.25 10x20x2 $4.87
12x12x2 $2.95 12x12x2 $6.85
12x20x2 $3.25 12x20x2 $7.27
12x24x2 $2.36 12x24x2 $4.69
14x20x2 $3.54 14x20x2 $7.27
14x28x2 $3.77 14x28x2 $7.92
14x30x2 $4.06 14x30x2 $8.76
15x18x2 $3.54 15x18x2 $7.27
15x20x2 $2.38 15x20x2 $7.92
16x16x2 $3.54 16x16x2 $7.27
16x20x2 $2.44 16x20x2 $3.67
16x24x2 $3.05 16x24x2 $7.92
16x25x2 $2.77 16x25x2 $5.45
16x32x2 $4.47 16x32x2 $9.11
18x24x2 $3.14 18x24x2 $8.76
18x25x2 $4.18 18x25x2 $8.76

18x35.5x2 $4.88 18x35.5x2 $12.61
20x20x2 $2.80 20x20x2 $5.41
20x24x2 $3.20 20x24x2 $4.35
20x25x2 $3.27 20x25x2 $4.46
20x30x2 $4.88 20x30x2 $10.92
22x27x2 $4.64 22x27x2 $9.56
24x24x2 $3.72 24x24x2 $6.88
25x25x2 $3.66 25x25x2 $7.29
12x24x4 Not Made in 4" 12x24x4 $19.12
22x28x2 $4.88 22x28x2 $13.06
26x29x2 $5.23 26x29x2 $14.97

TRI-DEK 4-PLYTRI-DEK 4-PLY



12x24x4 Not Made in 4" 12x24x4 $19.12
16x20x4 Not Made in 4" 16x20x4 $19.78
16x25x4 Not Made in 4" 16x25x4 $22.87
20x20x4 Not Made in 4" 20x20x4 $23.06
20x25x4 Not Made in 4" 20x25x4 $27.31
24x24x4 Not Made in 4" 24x24x4 $29.07



Lowest Price

$2.04
$2.83
$3.27
$3.02
$1.19
$2.00
$2.91
$2.38
$1.85
$1.24
$1.32
$2.69



$1.63
$2.47
$2.47
$3.21
$2.18
$1.44
$2.42
$4.04
$2.11
$2.91
$2.91
$1.51
$1.81
$2.87
$2.75
$2.16
$3.52
$1.86
$2.00
$1.94
$1.51
$1.64
$3.31
$3.31
$2.71
$1.63
$2.41
$1.60
$1.97
$1.79
$3.81
$2.10



$2.08
$4.07
$1.79
$2.00
$2.03
$3.15
$4.44
$2.38
$2.65
$3.24
$3.52
$3.62
$3.62
$4.17
$3.93
$2.91
$2.46
$1.66
$2.81
$2.81

$24.81
$36.51
$31.86

$2.60
$2.69



$3.10
$3.24
$2.69
$2.69
$3.01
$2.44
$2.69
$1.95
$3.01
$3.17
$3.29
$2.69
$2.90
$3.52
$2.35
$1.95
$3.29
$4.18
$3.52
$3.54
$3.38
$2.25
$2.58
$3.85
$3.68
$2.65
$4.26
$3.58
$2.69
$2.60



$2.69
$2.69
$2.69
$2.27
$3.40
$3.63
$2.90
$3.23
$2.38
$2.98
$2.20
$2.81
$2.51
$4.00
$3.00
$3.95
$4.46
$2.54
$3.00
$3.08
$4.42
$4.42
$3.52
$3.66
$2.14
$4.46
$4.80



$2.45
$2.71
$2.95
$2.95
$3.57
$4.06


